

DOT_RGGB01

WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

DATE: 06/19/2012

*** BID CHECK REPORT ***

TIME: 14:25

PS&E JOB NO : 11X162 REVISION NO :
 CONTRACT NO : 008340 REGION NO : 9
 VERSION NO : 1 WORK ORDER# : FT1781
 HWY : SR 519
 TITLE : SR 519
 SEATTLE FERRY TERMINAL
 TIMBER TRESTLE PRESERVATION
 11X162
 PROJECT :
 COUNTY(S) : KING

BIDS OPENED ON : Jul 18 2012

AWARDED ON :

| | | | | | | |
|-------|-----------------------------|-------|----------------------------|-------|--------------------------------|-------|
| ----- | LOW BIDDER | ----- | 2ND BIDDER | ----- | 3RD BIDDER | ----- |
| | PACIFIC PILE & MARINE, L.P. | | QUIGG BROS., INC. | | AMERICAN CONSTRUCTION CO., INC | |
| | 700 S RIVERSIDE DR | | 819 W STATE ST | | 1501 TAYLOR WAY | |
| | | | 98520-5934 | | | |
| | SEATTLE WA 981084364 | | ABERDEEN WA 985200281 | | TACOMA WA 984214100 | |
| | CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100609 | | CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 680000 | | CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 026000 | |

| ITEM NO. | ITEM DESCRIPTION | UNIT MEAS | ENGR'S. EST. | | % DIFF./ AMT.DIFF. | PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT | % DIFF./ AMT.DIFF. | PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT | % DIFF./ AMT.DIFF. | PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT | % DIFF./ AMT.DIFF. |
|-------------|---|-----------|------------------------------|------------------------------|--------------------|------------------------------|--------------------|------------------------------|--------------------|------------------------------|--------------------|
| | | | PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT | PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT | | | | | | | |
| PREPARATION | | | | | | | | | | | |
| 1 | MOBILIZATION | L.S. | | | -10.04 % | | -37.96 % | | | | 8.58 % |
| | | | 64,470.00 | 58,000.00 | -6,470.00 | 40,000.00 | -24,470.00 | 70,000.00 | 5,530.00 | | |
| 2 | REMOVING ASPHALT CONC. PAVEMENT | S.Y. | | | 51.43 % | | 8.57 % | | | | -48.57 % |
| | 2300.0000 | | 17.5000 | 26.5000 | 20,700.00 | 19.0000 | 3,450.00 | 9.0000 | 20,700.00 | -19,550.00 | |
| | | | 40,250.00 | 60,950.00 | | 43,700.00 | | 20,700.00 | | | |
| GRADING | | | | | | | | | | | |
| 3 | GRAVEL BORROW INCL. HAUL | TON | | | -25.00 % | | -55.00 % | | | | 200.00 % |
| | 4.0000 | | 200.0000 | 150.0000 | -200.00 | 90.0000 | -440.00 | 600.0000 | 2,400.00 | 1,600.00 | |
| | | | 800.00 | 600.00 | | 360.00 | | 2,400.00 | | | |
| 4 | EMBANKMENT COMPACTION | C.Y. | | | -33.33 % | | -66.67 % | | | | 100.00 % |
| | 2.0000 | | 150.0000 | 100.0000 | -100.00 | 50.0000 | -200.00 | 300.0000 | 600.00 | 300.00 | |
| | | | 300.00 | 200.00 | | 100.00 | | 600.00 | | | |
| STRUCTURE | | | | | | | | | | | |
| 5 | FORCE ACCOUNT EXTRA PILE EXCAVATION | EST. | | | 0.00 % | | 0.00 % | | | | 0.00 % |
| | | | 8,000.00 | 8,000.00 | | 8,000.00 | | 8,000.00 | | | |
| 6 | TIMBER PILE REPLACEMENT (G. L. ELEV -30.0 TO -15.0) | EACH | | | -5.67 % | | 11.11 % | | | | 16.67 % |
| | 9.0000 | | 18,000.0000 | 16,980.0000 | -9,180.00 | 20,000.0000 | 18,000.00 | 21,000.0000 | 189,000.00 | 27,000.00 | |
| | | | 162,000.00 | 152,820.00 | | 180,000.00 | | 189,000.00 | | | |
| 7 | TIMBER PILE REPLACEMENT (G. L. ELEV -14.9 TO 0.0) | EACH | | | -4.19 % | | 10.47 % | | | | 22.09 % |
| | 9.0000 | | 17,200.0000 | 16,480.0000 | -6,480.00 | 19,000.0000 | 16,200.00 | 21,000.0000 | 189,000.00 | 34,200.00 | |
| | | | 154,800.00 | 148,320.00 | | 171,000.00 | | 189,000.00 | | | |
| 8 | TIMBER PILE REPLACEMENT (G. L. ELEV >0.0) | EACH | | | -29.25 % | | -5.66 % | | | | -37.11 % |
| | 3.0000 | | 15,900.0000 | 11,250.0000 | -13,950.00 | 15,000.0000 | -2,700.00 | 10,000.0000 | 30,000.00 | -17,700.00 | |
| | | | 47,700.00 | 33,750.00 | | 45,000.00 | | 30,000.00 | | | |
| 9 | TIMBER PILE SHIMMING | EACH | | | 221.25 % | | 50.00 % | | | | 200.00 % |
| | 7.0000 | | 400.0000 | 1,285.0000 | 6,195.00 | 600.0000 | 1,400.00 | 1,200.0000 | 8,400.00 | 5,600.00 | |
| | | | 2,800.00 | 8,995.00 | | 4,200.00 | | 8,400.00 | | | |
| 10 | TIMBER CAP REPAIR | L.S. | | | 11.06 % | | 5.88 % | | | | 311.76 % |
| | | | 17,000.00 | 18,880.00 | 1,880.00 | 18,000.00 | 1,000.00 | 70,000.00 | 53,000.00 | | |

DOT_RGGB01

WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 * * * BID CHECK REPORT * * *

DATE: 06/19/2012
 TIME: 14:25

PS&E JOB NO : 11X162 REVISION NO :
 CONTRACT NO : 008340 REGION NO : 9
 VERSION NO : 1 WORK ORDER# : FT1781
 HWY : SR 519
 TITLE : SR 519
 SEATTLE FERRY TERMINAL
 TIMBER TRESTLE PRESERVATION
 11X162
 PROJECT :
 COUNTY(S) : KING

BIDS OPENED ON : Jul 18 2012
 AWARDED ON :

| | | | | | | |
|-------|-----------------------------|-------|----------------------------|-------|--------------------------------|-------|
| ----- | LOW BIDDER | ----- | 2ND BIDDER | ----- | 3RD BIDDER | ----- |
| | PACIFIC PILE & MARINE, L.P. | | QUIGG BROS., INC. | | AMERICAN CONSTRUCTION CO., INC | |
| | 700 S RIVERSIDE DR | | 819 W STATE ST | | 1501 TAYLOR WAY | |
| | | | 98520-5934 | | | |
| | SEATTLE WA 981084364 | | ABERDEEN WA 985200281 | | TACOMA WA 984214100 | |
| | CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100609 | | CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 680000 | | CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 026000 | |

| ITEM NO. | ITEM DESCRIPTION | UNIT MEAS | ENGR'S. EST. | | | | | | |
|------------------------------|-------------------------------|-----------|---------------------------------|---------------------------------|-----------------------|---------------------------------|-----------------------|---------------------------------|-----------------------|
| | | | PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT | PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT | % DIFF./ AMT.DIFF. | PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT | % DIFF./ AMT.DIFF. | PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT | % DIFF./ AMT.DIFF. |
| SURFACING | | | | | | | | | |
| 11 | CRUSHED SURFACING BASE COURSE | | | | | | | | |
| | 1.0000 TON | | 500.0000 | 150.0000 | -70.00 % | 100.0000 | -80.00 % | 700.0000 | 40.00 % |
| | | | 500.00 | 150.00 | -350.00 | 100.00 | -400.00 | 700.00 | 200.00 |
| LIQUID ASPHALT | | | | | | | | | |
| 12 | ANTI-STRIPPING ADDITIVE | | | | | | | | |
| | EST. | | | | 0.00 % | | 0.00 % | | 0.00 % |
| | | | 440.00 | 440.00 | | 440.00 | | 440.00 | |
| BITUMINOUS SURFACE TREATMENT | | | | | | | | | |
| 13 | SLURRY SEAL | | | | | | | | |
| | 820.0000 S.Y. | | 11.0000 | 11.2000 | 1.82 % | 5.0000 | -54.55 % | 11.0000 | 0.00 % |
| | | | 9,020.00 | 9,184.00 | 164.00 | 4,100.00 | -4,920.00 | 9,020.00 | 0.00 |
| HOT MIX ASPHALT | | | | | | | | | |
| 14 | PLANING BITUMINOUS PAVEMENT | | | | | | | | |
| | 380.0000 S.Y. | | 15.7500 | 12.6500 | -19.68 % | 19.0000 | 20.63 % | 14.0000 | -11.11 % |
| | | | 5,985.00 | 4,807.00 | -1,178.00 | 7,220.00 | 1,235.00 | 5,320.00 | -665.00 |
| 15 | HMA CL. 1/2 IN. PG 64-22 | | | | | | | | |
| | 440.0000 TON | | 145.0000 | 118.0000 | -18.62 % | 100.0000 | -31.03 % | 110.0000 | -24.14 % |
| | | | 63,800.00 | 51,920.00 | -11,880.00 | 44,000.00 | -19,800.00 | 48,400.00 | -15,400.00 |
| 16 | ASPHALT COST PRICE ADJUSTMENT | | | | | | | | |
| | CALC | | | | 0.00 % | | 0.00 % | | 0.00 % |
| | | | 880.00 | 880.00 | | 880.00 | | 880.00 | |
| TRAFFIC | | | | | | | | | |
| 17 | PAINT LINE | | | | | | | | |
| | 2500.0000 L.F. | | 1.0000 | 1.1000 | 10.00 % | 2.2500 | 125.00 % | 1.0000 | 0.00 % |
| | | | 2,500.00 | 2,750.00 | 250.00 | 5,625.00 | 3,125.00 | 2,500.00 | 0.00 |
| 18 | PLASTIC TRAFFIC ARROW | | | | | | | | |
| | 6.0000 EACH | | 150.0000 | 390.0000 | 160.00 % | 200.0000 | 33.33 % | 400.0000 | 166.67 % |
| | | | 900.00 | 2,340.00 | 1,440.00 | 1,200.00 | 300.00 | 2,400.00 | 1,500.00 |
| 19 | PLASTIC STOP LINE | | | | | | | | |
| | 80.0000 L.F. | | 10.0000 | 22.0000 | 120.00 % | 50.0000 | 400.00 % | 20.0000 | 100.00 % |
| | | | 800.00 | 1,760.00 | 960.00 | 4,000.00 | 3,200.00 | 1,600.00 | 800.00 |

DOT_RGGB01

WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

* * * BID CHECK REPORT * * *

DATE: 06/19/2012

TIME: 14:25

PS&E JOB NO : 11X162 REVISION NO :
 CONTRACT NO : 008340 REGION NO : 9
 VERSION NO : 1 WORK ORDER# : FT1781
 HWY : SR 519
 TITLE : SR 519
 SEATTLE FERRY TERMINAL
 TIMBER TRESTLE PRESERVATION
 11X162
 PROJECT :
 COUNTY(S) : KING

BIDS OPENED ON : Jul 18 2012

AWARDED ON :

| | | |
|---|--|--|
| ----- LOW BIDDER ----- | ----- 2ND BIDDER ----- | ----- 3RD BIDDER ----- |
| PACIFIC PILE & MARINE, L.P. 700 S RIVERSIDE DR SEATTLE WA 981084364 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100609 | QUIGG BROS., INC. 819 W STATE ST 98520-5934 ABERDEEN WA 985200281 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 680000 | AMERICAN CONSTRUCTION CO., INC 1501 TAYLOR WAY TACOMA WA 984214100 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 026000 |

| ITEM NO. | ITEM DESCRIPTION EST. QUANTITY | UNIT MEAS | ENGR'S. EST. | | % DIFF./ AMT.DIFF. | 2ND BIDDER | | % DIFF./ AMT.DIFF. | 3RD BIDDER | |
|--------------|--|-----------|---------------------------------|---------------------------------|------------------------|---------------------------------|---------------------------------|-----------------------|---------------------------------|---------------------------------|
| | | | PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT | PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT | | PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT | PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT | | PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT | PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT |
| TRAFFIC | | | | | | | | | | |
| 20 | PAINTED TRAFFIC LETTER 29.0000 | EACH | 45.0000 1,305.00 | 72.0000 2,088.00 | 60.00 % 783.00 | 115.0000 3,335.00 | 155.56 % 2,030.00 | 70.0000 2,030.00 | 55.56 % 725.00 | |
| 21 | TEMPORARY PAVEMENT MARKING 2300.0000 | L.F. | 1.0000 2,300.00 | 1.0000 2,300.00 | 0.00 % 0.00 | 1.0000 2,300.00 | 0.00 % 0.00 | 2.0000 4,600.00 | 100.00 % 2,300.00 | |
| OTHER ITEMS | | | | | | | | | | |
| 22 | INLET PROTECTION 30.0000 | EACH | 115.0000 3,450.00 | 62.0000 1,860.00 | -46.09 % -1,590.00 | 150.0000 4,500.00 | 30.43 % 1,050.00 | 180.0000 5,400.00 | 56.52 % 1,950.00 | |
| 23 | FORCE ACCOUNT MISCELLANEOUS REPAIRS EST. | | 8,000.00 | 8,000.00 | 0.00 % | 8,000.00 | 0.00 % | 8,000.00 | 0.00 % | |
| 24 | MINOR CHANGE CALC | | -1.00 | -1.00 | 0.00 % | -1.00 | 0.00 % | -1.00 | 0.00 % | |
| 25 | SPCC PLAN L.S. | | 1,001.00 | 600.00 | -40.06 % -401.00 | 1,000.00 | -0.10 % -1.00 | 500.00 | -50.05 % -501.00 | |
| BASE TOTAL | | | \$599,000.00 | \$579,593.00 | -3.24 % | \$597,059.00 | -0.32 % | \$679,889.00 | 13.50 % | |
| ALTERNATE A1 | | | | | | | | | | |
| 26 | MOBILIZATION L.S. | | 7,450.40 | 2,315.00 | -68.93 % -5,135.40 | 9,000.00 | 20.80 % 1,549.60 | 100.00 | -98.66 % -7,350.40 | |
| 27 | REMOVAL OF STRUCTURE AND OBSTRUCTION L.S. | | 16,500.00 | 3,400.00 | -79.39 % -13,100.00 | 23,500.00 | 42.42 % 7,000.00 | 6,000.00 | -63.64 % -10,500.00 | |

DOT_RGGB01

WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

DATE: 06/19/2012

* * * BID CHECK REPORT * * *

TIME: 14:25

PS&E JOB NO : 11X162 REVISION NO :
 CONTRACT NO : 008340 REGION NO : 9
 VERSION NO : 1 WORK ORDER# : FT1781
 HWY : SR 519
 TITLE : SR 519
 SEATTLE FERRY TERMINAL
 TIMBER TRESTLE PRESERVATION
 11X162
 PROJECT :
 COUNTY(S) : KING

BIDS OPENED ON : Jul 18 2012

AWARDED ON :

| | | |
|---|--|--|
| ----- LOW BIDDER ----- | ----- 2ND BIDDER ----- | ----- 3RD BIDDER ----- |
| PACIFIC PILE & MARINE, L.P. 700 S RIVERSIDE DR SEATTLE WA 981084364 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100609 | QUIGG BROS., INC. 819 W STATE ST 98520-5934 ABERDEEN WA 985200281 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 680000 | AMERICAN CONSTRUCTION CO., INC 1501 TAYLOR WAY TACOMA WA 984214100 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 026000 |

| ITEM NO. | ITEM DESCRIPTION EST. QUANTITY | UNIT MEAS | ENGR'S. EST. PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT | PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT | % DIFF./ AMT.DIFF. | PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT | % DIFF./ AMT.DIFF. | PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT | % DIFF./ AMT.DIFF. |
|--------------|------------------------------------|--------------|---|---------------------------------|-----------------------|---------------------------------|-----------------------|---------------------------------|-----------------------|
| ALTERNATE A1 | | | | | | | | | |
| 28 | TIMBER AND LUMBER PRESSURE TREATED | | | | | | | | |
| | 6.5600 | MBM | 6,410.0000 | 4,665.0000 | -27.22 % | 7,000.0000 | 9.20 % | 3,600.0000 | -43.84 % |
| | | | 42,049.60 | 30,602.40 | -11,447.20 | 45,920.00 | 3,870.40 | 23,616.00 | -18,433.60 |
| | ALTERNATE A1 TOTAL | | <u>\$66,000.00</u> | <u>\$36,317.40</u> | <u>-44.97 %</u> | <u>\$78,420.00</u> | <u>18.82 %</u> | <u>\$29,716.00</u> | <u>-54.98 %</u> |
| | BASE TOTAL | | <u>\$599,000.00</u> | <u>\$579,593.00</u> | <u>-3.24 %</u> | <u>\$597,059.00</u> | <u>-0.32 %</u> | <u>\$679,889.00</u> | <u>13.50 %</u> |
| | BASE + A1 CONTRACT TOTAL (A) | | <u>\$665,000.00</u> | <u>\$615,910.40</u> | <u>-7.38 %</u> | <u>\$675,479.00</u> | <u>1.58 %</u> | <u>\$709,605.00</u> | <u>6.71 %</u> |

DOT_RGGB01

WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

DATE: 06/19/2012

* * * BID CHECK REPORT * * *

TIME: 14:25

PS&E JOB NO : 11X162 REVISION NO :
 CONTRACT NO : 008340 REGION NO : 9
 VERSION NO : 1 WORK ORDER# : FT1781
 HWY : SR 519
 TITLE : SR 519
 SEATTLE FERRY TERMINAL
 TIMBER TRESTLE PRESERVATION
 11X162
 PROJECT :
 COUNTY(S) : KING

BIDS OPENED ON : Jul 18 2012

AWARDED ON :

----- 4TH BIDDER -----
 MANSON CONSTRUCTION CO.
 5209 E MARGINAL WAY S
 98134-2429
 SEATTLE WA 981240067
 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 518000

CONTRACTOR NUMBER :

| ITEM NO. | ITEM DESCRIPTION | UNIT MEAS | ENGR'S. EST. PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT | PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT | % DIFF./ AMT.DIFF. | PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT | % DIFF./ AMT.DIFF. | PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT | % DIFF./ AMT.DIFF. |
|-------------|---|-----------|--|---------------------------------|-----------------------|---------------------------------|-----------------------|---------------------------------|-----------------------|
| PREPARATION | | | | | | | | | |
| 1 | MOBILIZATION | L.S. | | | | | | | |
| | | | 64,470.00 | 48,000.00 | -25.55 % | | | | -100.00 % |
| | | | | | | 0.00 | | | |
| 2 | REMOVING ASPHALT CONC. PAVEMENT | S.Y. | | | | | | | |
| | 2300.0000 | | 17.5000 | 23.0000 | 31.43 % | | | | -100.00 % |
| | | | 40,250.00 | 52,900.00 | 12,650.00 | | | | 0.00 |
| GRADING | | | | | | | | | |
| 3 | GRAVEL BORROW INCL. HAUL | TON | | | | | | | |
| | 4.0000 | | 200.0000 | 500.0000 | 150.00 % | | | | -100.00 % |
| | | | 800.00 | 2,000.00 | 1,200.00 | | | | 0.00 |
| 4 | EMBANKMENT COMPACTION | C.Y. | | | | | | | |
| | 2.0000 | | 150.0000 | 265.0000 | 76.67 % | | | | -100.00 % |
| | | | 300.00 | 530.00 | 230.00 | | | | 0.00 |
| STRUCTURE | | | | | | | | | |
| 5 | FORCE ACCOUNT EXTRA PILE EXCAVATION | EST. | | | | | | | |
| | | | 8,000.00 | 8,000.00 | 0.00 % | | | | 0.00 % |
| 6 | TIMBER PILE REPLACEMENT (G. L. ELEV -30.0 TO -15.0) | EACH | | | | | | | |
| | 9.0000 | | 18,000.0000 | 27,500.0000 | 52.78 % | | | | -100.00 % |
| | | | 162,000.00 | 247,500.00 | 85,500.00 | | | | 0.00 |
| 7 | TIMBER PILE REPLACEMENT (G. L. ELEV -14.9 TO 0.0) | EACH | | | | | | | |
| | 9.0000 | | 17,200.0000 | 26,500.0000 | 54.07 % | | | | -100.00 % |
| | | | 154,800.00 | 238,500.00 | 83,700.00 | | | | 0.00 |
| 8 | TIMBER PILE REPLACEMENT (G. L. ELEV >0.0) | EACH | | | | | | | |
| | 3.0000 | | 15,900.0000 | 23,450.0000 | 47.48 % | | | | -100.00 % |
| | | | 47,700.00 | 70,350.00 | 22,650.00 | | | | 0.00 |
| 9 | TIMBER PILE SHIMMING | EACH | | | | | | | |
| | 7.0000 | | 400.0000 | 1,700.0000 | 325.00 % | | | | -100.00 % |
| | | | 2,800.00 | 11,900.00 | 9,100.00 | | | | 0.00 |
| 10 | TIMBER CAP REPAIR | L.S. | | | | | | | |
| | | | 17,000.00 | 15,500.00 | -8.82 % | | | | -100.00 % |

DOT_RGGB01

WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

DATE: 06/19/2012

* * * BID CHECK REPORT * * *

TIME: 14:25

PS&E JOB NO : 11X162 REVISION NO :
 CONTRACT NO : 008340 REGION NO : 9
 VERSION NO : 1 WORK ORDER# : FT1781
 HWY : SR 519
 TITLE : SR 519
 SEATTLE FERRY TERMINAL
 TIMBER TRESTLE PRESERVATION
 11X162
 PROJECT :
 COUNTY(S) : KING

BIDS OPENED ON : Jul 18 2012

AWARDED ON :

----- 4TH BIDDER -----

MANSON CONSTRUCTION CO.
 5209 E MARGINAL WAY S
 98134-2429
 SEATTLE WA 981240067

CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 518000 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : CONTRACTOR NUMBER :

| ITEM NO. | ITEM DESCRIPTION EST. QUANTITY | UNIT MEAS | ENGR'S. EST. | | % DIFF./ AMT.DIFF. | PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT | % DIFF./ AMT.DIFF. | PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT | % DIFF./ AMT.DIFF. |
|------------------------------|-----------------------------------|--------------|---------------------------------|---------------------------------|-----------------------|---------------------------------|-----------------------|---------------------------------|-----------------------|
| | | | PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT | PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT | | | | | |
| SURFACING | | | | | | | | | |
| 11 | CRUSHED SURFACING BASE COURSE | | | | | | | | |
| | 1.0000 | TON | 500.0000 | 180.0000 | -64.00 % | | | -100.00 % | |
| | | | 500.00 | 180.00 | -320.00 | 0.00 | | | |
| LIQUID ASPHALT | | | | | | | | | |
| 12 | ANTI-STRIPPING ADDITIVE | | | | | | | | |
| | | EST. | | | 0.00 % | | | 0.00 % | |
| | | | 440.00 | 440.00 | | 0.00 | | | |
| BITUMINOUS SURFACE TREATMENT | | | | | | | | | |
| 13 | SLURRY SEAL | | | | | | | | |
| | 820.0000 | S.Y. | 11.0000 | 15.0000 | 36.36 % | | | -100.00 % | |
| | | | 9,020.00 | 12,300.00 | 3,280.00 | 0.00 | | | |
| HOT MIX ASPHALT | | | | | | | | | |
| 14 | PLANING BITUMINOUS PAVEMENT | | | | | | | | |
| | 380.0000 | S.Y. | 15.7500 | 16.0000 | 1.59 % | | | -100.00 % | |
| | | | 5,985.00 | 6,080.00 | 95.00 | 0.00 | | | |
| 15 | HMA CL. 1/2 IN. PG 64-22 | | | | | | | | |
| | 440.0000 | TON | 145.0000 | 100.0000 | -31.03 % | | | -100.00 % | |
| | | | 63,800.00 | 44,000.00 | -19,800.00 | 0.00 | | | |
| 16 | ASPHALT COST PRICE ADJUSTMENT | | | | | | | | |
| | | CALC | | | 0.00 % | | | 0.00 % | |
| | | | 880.00 | 880.00 | | 0.00 | | | |
| TRAFFIC | | | | | | | | | |
| 17 | PAINT LINE | | | | | | | | |
| | 2500.0000 | L.F. | 1.0000 | 2.2500 | 125.00 % | | | -100.00 % | |
| | | | 2,500.00 | 5,625.00 | 3,125.00 | 0.00 | | | |
| 18 | PLASTIC TRAFFIC ARROW | | | | | | | | |
| | 6.0000 | EACH | 150.0000 | 175.0000 | 16.67 % | | | -100.00 % | |
| | | | 900.00 | 1,050.00 | 150.00 | 0.00 | | | |
| 19 | PLASTIC STOP LINE | | | | | | | | |
| | 80.0000 | L.F. | 10.0000 | 45.0000 | 350.00 % | | | -100.00 % | |
| | | | 800.00 | 3,600.00 | 2,800.00 | 0.00 | | | |

DOT_RGGB01

WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

* * * BID CHECK REPORT * * *

DATE: 06/19/2012

TIME: 14:25

PS&E JOB NO : 11X162 REVISION NO :
 CONTRACT NO : 008340 REGION NO : 9
 VERSION NO : 1 WORK ORDER# : FT1781
 HWY : SR 519
 TITLE : SR 519
 SEATTLE FERRY TERMINAL
 TIMBER TRESTLE PRESERVATION
 11X162
 PROJECT :
 COUNTY(S) : KING

BIDS OPENED ON : Jul 18 2012

AWARDED ON :

----- 4TH BIDDER -----
 MANSON CONSTRUCTION CO.
 5209 E MARGINAL WAY S
 98134-2429
 SEATTLE WA 981240067
 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 518000

CONTRACTOR NUMBER :
 CONTRACTOR NUMBER :

| ITEM NO. | ITEM DESCRIPTION EST. QUANTITY | UNIT MEAS | ENGR'S. EST. | | % DIFF./ AMT.DIFF. | PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT | % DIFF./ AMT.DIFF. | PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT | % DIFF./ AMT.DIFF. |
|--------------|--------------------------------------|------------|---------------------------------|---------------------------------|-----------------------|---------------------------------|-----------------------|---------------------------------|-----------------------|
| | | | PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT | PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT | | | | | |
| TRAFFIC | | | | | | | | | |
| 20 | PAINTED TRAFFIC LETTER | | | | | | | | |
| | 29.0000 | EACH | 45.0000 | 110.0000 | 144.44 % | | | | -100.00 % |
| | | | 1,305.00 | 3,190.00 | 1,885.00 | 0.00 | | | |
| 21 | TEMPORARY PAVEMENT MARKING | | | | | | | | |
| | 2300.0000 | L.F. | 1.0000 | 0.5000 | -50.00 % | | | | -100.00 % |
| | | | 2,300.00 | 1,150.00 | -1,150.00 | 0.00 | | | |
| OTHER ITEMS | | | | | | | | | |
| 22 | INLET PROTECTION | | | | | | | | |
| | 30.0000 | EACH | 115.0000 | 100.0000 | -13.04 % | | | | -100.00 % |
| | | | 3,450.00 | 3,000.00 | -450.00 | 0.00 | | | |
| 23 | FORCE ACCOUNT MISCELLANEOUS REPAIRS | | | | | | | | |
| | | EST. | | | 0.00 % | | | | 0.00 % |
| | | | 8,000.00 | 8,000.00 | | 0.00 | | | |
| 24 | MINOR CHANGE | | | | | | | | |
| | | CALC | | | 0.00 % | | | | 0.00 % |
| | | | -1.00 | -1.00 | | 0.00 | | | |
| 25 | SPCC PLAN | | | | | | | | |
| | | L.S. | | | -0.10 % | | | | -100.00 % |
| | | | 1,001.00 | 1,000.00 | -1.00 | 0.00 | | | |
| | | BASE TOTAL | \$599,000.00 | \$785,674.00 | 31.16 % | | | | % |
| ALTERNATE A1 | | | | | | | | | |
| 26 | MOBILIZATION | | | | | | | | |
| | | L.S. | | | 128.18 % | | | | -100.00 % |
| | | | 7,450.40 | 17,000.00 | 9,549.60 | 0.00 | | | |
| 27 | REMOVAL OF STRUCTURE AND OBSTRUCTION | | | | | | | | |
| | | L.S. | | | 81.82 % | | | | -100.00 % |
| | | | 16,500.00 | 30,000.00 | 13,500.00 | 0.00 | | | |

DOT_RGGB01

WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

DATE: 06/19/2012

* * * BID CHECK REPORT * * *

TIME: 14:25

PS&E JOB NO : 11X162 REVISION NO :
 CONTRACT NO : 008340 REGION NO : 9
 VERSION NO : 1 WORK ORDER# : FT1781
 HWY : SR 519
 TITLE : SR 519
 SEATTLE FERRY TERMINAL
 TIMBER TRESTLE PRESERVATION
 11X162
 PROJECT :
 COUNTY(S) : KING

BIDS OPENED ON : Jul 18 2012
 AWARDED ON :

----- 4TH BIDDER -----
 MANSON CONSTRUCTION CO.
 5209 E MARGINAL WAY S
 98134-2429
 SEATTLE WA 981240067
 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 518000

CONTRACTOR NUMBER :

| ITEM NO. | ITEM DESCRIPTION | UNIT MEAS | ENGR'S. EST. PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT | PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT | % DIFF./ AMT.DIFF. | PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT | % DIFF./ AMT.DIFF. | PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT | % DIFF./ AMT.DIFF. |
|----------|------------------|-----------|---|---------------------------------|-----------------------|---------------------------------|-----------------------|---------------------------------|-----------------------|
|----------|------------------|-----------|---|---------------------------------|-----------------------|---------------------------------|-----------------------|---------------------------------|-----------------------|

ALTERNATE A1

28 TIMBER AND LUMBER PRESSURE TREATED
 6.5600 MBM

| | | | | |
|------------|------------|----------|------|-----------|
| 6,410.0000 | 7,200.0000 | 12.32 % | | -100.00 % |
| 42,049.60 | 47,232.00 | 5,182.40 | 0.00 | |

ALTERNATE A1 TOTAL

| | | |
|-------------|-------------|---------|
| \$66,000.00 | \$94,232.00 | 42.78 % |
|-------------|-------------|---------|

BASE TOTAL

\$599,000.00

\$785,674.00

31.16%

NO BID THIS ALTERNATE

NO BID THIS ALTERNATE

BASE + A1 CONTRACT TOTAL (A)

\$665,000.00

\$879,906.00

32.32%

NO BID THIS ALTERNATE

NO BID THIS ALTERNATE

DOT_RGGB01

WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

PS&E JOB NO: 11X162

* * * ALTERNATE COMBINATION BIDS * * *

BIDS OPENED ON:

CONTRACT NO: 008340

* * * RANKED BY DOLLAR AMOUNT * * *

Jul 18 2012

TITLE: SR 519

SEATTLE FERRY TERMINAL
TIMBER TRESTLE PRESERVATION
11X162

REGION: 9

HWY: SR 519

| | | | |
|---|--------------|-----------|---|
| 1 | \$615,910.40 | BASE + A1 | PACIFIC PILE & MARINE, L.P. 700 S RIVERSIDE DR SEATTLE, WA 981084364 |
| 2 | \$675,479.00 | BASE + A1 | QUIGG BROS., INC. 819 W STATE ST 98520-5934 PO BOX 1707 ABERDEEN, WA 985200281 |
| 3 | \$709,605.00 | BASE + A1 | AMERICAN CONSTRUCTION CO., INC. 1501 TAYLOR WAY TACOMA, WA 984214100 |
| 4 | \$879,906.00 | BASE + A1 | MANSON CONSTRUCTION CO. 5209 E MARGINAL WAY S 98134-2429 PO BOX 24067 SEATTLE, WA 981240067 |