

PS&E JOB NO : 07C518 REVISION NO :  
 CONTRACT NO : 007371 REGION NO : 3  
 VERSION NO : 4 WORK ORDER# : XL2912  
 HWY : SR 101  
 TITLE : US 101  
 MP 72.06 - SLOPE STABILIZATION  
 07C518  
 PROJECT : , STP-0101(295)  
 COUNTY(S) : GRAYS HARBOR

BIDS OPENED ON : Jun 20 2007  
 AWARDED ON : Jun 25 2007

----- LOW BIDDER -----      ----- 2ND BIDDER -----  
 ROGNLIN'S, INC.                      QUIGG BROS., INC.  
 321 W STATE ST                      819 W STATE ST  
 98520-6143                              98520-5934  
 ABERDEEN WA 985200078              ABERDEEN WA 985200281  
 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 706350      CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 680000

ITEM NO.	ITEM DESCRIPTION EST. QUANTITY	UNIT MEAS	ENGR'S. EST.		% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.	ENGR'S. EST.		% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.
			PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT		PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	
PREPARATION								
1	MOBILIZATION							
		L.S.			-20.79%			88.12%
			101,000.00	80,000.00	-21,000.00	190,000.00	89,000.00	
2	CLEARING AND GRUBBING							
	0.3000	ACRE	6,000.0000	23,000.0000	283.33%	20,000.0000	233.33%	
			1,800.00	6,900.00	5,100.00	6,000.00	4,200.00	
GRADING								
3	SITE PREPERATION							
		EST.			0.00%			0.00%
			72,000.00	72,000.00		72,000.00		
4	ROADWAY EXCAVATION INCL. HAUL							
	60.4000	C.Y.	30.0000	38.0000	26.67%	50.0000	66.67%	
			1,812.00	2,295.20	483.20	3,020.00	1,208.00	
5	SELECT BORROW INCL. HAUL							
	750.0000	TON	10.0000	25.0000	150.00%	20.0000	100.00%	
			7,500.00	18,750.00	11,250.00	15,000.00	7,500.00	
6	EMBANKMENT COMPACTION							
	60.0000	C.Y.	2.0000	15.0000	650.00%	10.0000	400.00%	
			120.00	900.00	780.00	600.00	480.00	
DRAINAGE								
7	HORIZONTAL DRAIN							
	1400.0000	L.F.	25.0000	30.0000	20.00%	40.0000	60.00%	
			35,000.00	42,000.00	7,000.00	56,000.00	21,000.00	
8	QUARRY SPALLS FOR ACCESS ROAD							
	1200.0000	TON	30.0000	13.0000	-56.67%	25.0000	-16.67%	
			36,000.00	15,600.00	-20,400.00	30,000.00	-6,000.00	
9	PLAIN ST. CULV. PIPE 0.064 IN. TH. 18 IN. DIAM.							
	95.0000	L.F.	30.0000	40.0000	33.33%	150.0000	400.00%	
			2,850.00	3,800.00	950.00	14,250.00	11,400.00	
STRUCTURE								
10	SOIL EXCAVATION FOR ROCK SHAFT INCL. HAUL							
	695.0000	C.Y.	420.0000	500.0000	19.05%	475.0000	13.10%	
			291,900.00	347,500.00	55,600.00	330,125.00	38,225.00	

PS&E JOB NO : 07C518 REVISION NO :  
 CONTRACT NO : 007371 REGION NO : 3  
 VERSION NO : 4 WORK ORDER# : XL2912  
 HWY : SR 101  
 TITLE : US 101  
 MP 72.06 - SLOPE STABILIZATION  
 07C518  
 PROJECT : , STP-0101(295)  
 COUNTY(S) : GRAYS HARBOR

BIDS OPENED ON : Jun 20 2007  
 AWARDED ON : Jun 25 2007

----- LOW BIDDER -----      ----- 2ND BIDDER -----  
 ROGNLIN'S, INC.                      QUIGG BROS., INC.  
 321 W STATE ST                      819 W STATE ST  
 98520-6143                              98520-5934  
 ABERDEEN WA 985200078              ABERDEEN WA 985200281  
 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 706350      CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 680000

ITEM NO.	ITEM DESCRIPTION EST. QUANTITY	UNIT MEAS	ENGR'S. EST.		% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.	ENGR'S. EST.		% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.
			PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT		PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	
STRUCTURE								
11	BORING CONTROL F.A.	EST.			0.00 %			0.00 %
			50,000.00	50,000.00		50,000.00		
12	QUARRY SPALLS							
	1300.0000	TON	100.0000	35.0000	-65.00 %	30.0000	-70.00 %	
			130,000.00	45,500.00	-84,500.00	39,000.00	-91,000.00	
SURFACING								
13	CRUSHED SURFACING BASE COURSE							
	434.0000	TON	30.0000	18.0000	-40.00 %	30.0000	0.00 %	
			13,020.00	7,812.00	-5,208.00	13,020.00	0.00	
HOT MIX ASPHALT								
14	PLANING BITUMINOUS PAVEMENT							
	1750.0000	S.Y.	10.0000	5.5000	-45.00 %	6.0000	-40.00 %	
			17,500.00	9,625.00	-7,875.00	10,500.00	-7,000.00	
15	HMA CL. 1/2 IN. PG 58-22							
	500.0000	TON	100.0000	104.0000	4.00 %	100.0000	0.00 %	
			50,000.00	52,000.00	2,000.00	50,000.00	0.00	
EROSION CONTROL AND PLANTING								
16	ESC LEAD							
	10.0000	DAY	100.0000	250.0000	150.00 %	250.0000	150.00 %	
			1,000.00	2,500.00	1,500.00	2,500.00	1,500.00	
17	SILT FENCE							
	500.0000	L.F.	5.0000	6.0000	20.00 %	5.0000	0.00 %	
			2,500.00	3,000.00	500.00	2,500.00	0.00	
18	EROSION/WATER POLLUTION CONTROL							
		EST.			0.00 %		0.00 %	
			9,000.00	9,000.00		9,000.00		
19	SEEDING, FERTILIZING, AND MULCHING							
	0.2000	ACRE	3,000.0000	5,000.0000	66.67 %	4,000.0000	33.33 %	
			600.00	1,000.00	400.00	800.00	200.00	
20	LIMING							
	0.2000	ACRE	500.0000	4,000.0000	700.00 %	1,000.0000	100.00 %	
			100.00	800.00	700.00	200.00	100.00	

DOT\_RGGB01

WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

DATE: 06/12/2007

\* \* \* BID CHECK REPORT \* \* \*

TIME: 13:14

PS&E JOB NO : 07C518 REVISION NO :  
 CONTRACT NO : 007371 REGION NO : 3  
 VERSION NO : 4 WORK ORDER# : XL2912  
 HWY : SR 101  
 TITLE : US 101  
 MP 72.06 - SLOPE STABILIZATION  
 07C518  
 PROJECT : , STP-0101(295)  
 COUNTY(S) : GRAYS HARBOR

BIDS OPENED ON : Jun 20 2007  
 AWARDED ON : Jun 25 2007

----- LOW BIDDER ----- 2ND BIDDER -----  
 ROGNLIN'S, INC. QUIGG BROS., INC.  
 321 W STATE ST 819 W STATE ST  
 98520-6143 98520-5934  
 ABERDEEN WA 985200078 ABERDEEN WA 985200281  
 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 706350 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 680000

ITEM NO.	ITEM DESCRIPTION EST. QUANTITY	UNIT MEAS	ENGR'S. EST.		% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.	ENGR'S. EST.		% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.
			PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT		PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	
EROSION CONTROL AND PLANTING								
21	COARSE COMPOST							
	152.0000	C.Y.	30.0000	90.0000	200.00%	40.0000	33.33%	
			4,560.00	13,680.00	9,120.00	6,080.00	1,520.00	
22	HIGH VISIBILITY FENCE							
	1000.0000	L.F.	3.0000	5.0000	66.67%	3.0000	0.00%	
			3,000.00	5,000.00	2,000.00	3,000.00	0.00	
TRAFFIC								
23	PAINT LINE							
	1500.0000	L.F.	0.3000	1.8000	500.00%	1.5000	400.00%	
			450.00	2,700.00	2,250.00	2,250.00	1,800.00	
24	PLASTIC DRAINAGE MARKING							
	2.0000	EACH	50.0000	150.0000	200.00%	125.0000	150.00%	
			100.00	300.00	200.00	250.00	150.00	
25	TEMPORARY PAVEMENT MARKING							
	350.0000	L.F.	1.0000	2.0000	100.00%	3.0000	200.00%	
			350.00	700.00	350.00	1,050.00	700.00	
26	OTHER TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL							
		L.S.			100.00%		-50.00%	
			5,000.00	10,000.00	5,000.00	2,500.00	-2,500.00	
27	FLAGGERS AND SPOTTERS							
	300.0000	HR	50.0000	45.0000	-10.00%	50.0000	0.00%	
			15,000.00	13,500.00	-1,500.00	15,000.00	0.00	
28	TRAFFIC CONTROL SUPERVISOR							
		L.S.			233.33%		33.33%	
			7,500.00	25,000.00	17,500.00	10,000.00	2,500.00	
29	CONSTRUCTION SIGNS CLASS A							
	50.0000	S.F.	20.0000	25.0000	25.00%	15.0000	-25.00%	
			1,000.00	1,250.00	250.00	750.00	-250.00	
OTHER ITEMS								
30	STRUCTURE EXCAVATION CLASS B INCL. HAUL							
	115.0000	C.Y.	12.5000	65.0000	420.00%	30.0000	140.00%	
			1,437.50	7,475.00	6,037.50	3,450.00	2,012.50	
31	SHORING OR EXTRA EXCAVATION CLASS B							
	825.0000	S.F.	2.0000	60.0000	2,900.00%	20.0000	900.00%	
			1,650.00	49,500.00	47,850.00	16,500.00	14,850.00	

PS&E JOB NO : 07C518 REVISION NO :  
 CONTRACT NO : 007371 REGION NO : 3  
 VERSION NO : 4 WORK ORDER# : XL2912  
 HWY : SR 101  
 TITLE : US 101  
 MP 72.06 - SLOPE STABILIZATION  
 07C518  
 PROJECT : , STP-0101(295)  
 COUNTY(S) : GRAYS HARBOR

BIDS OPENED ON : Jun 20 2007  
 AWARDED ON : Jun 25 2007

----- LOW BIDDER -----      ----- 2ND BIDDER -----  
 ROGNLIN'S, INC.                      QUIGG BROS., INC.  
 321 W STATE ST                      819 W STATE ST  
 98520-6143                              98520-5934  
 ABERDEEN WA 985200078              ABERDEEN WA 985200281  
 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 706350      CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 680000

ITEM NO.	ITEM DESCRIPTION EST. QUANTITY	UNIT MEAS	ENGR'S. EST.		% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.	ENGR'S. EST.		% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.
			PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT		PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	
OTHER ITEMS								
32	CONNECTION TO DRAINAGE STRUCTURE							
	1.0000	EACH	600.0000	800.0000	33.33%	5,000.0000	733.33%	
			600.00	800.00	200.00	5,000.00	4,400.00	
33	ROADSIDE CLEANUP							
		EST.			0.00%		0.00%	
			5,000.00	5,000.00		5,000.00		
34	REIMBURSEMENT FOR THIRD PARTY DAMAGE							
		EST.			0.00%		0.00%	
			5.00	5.00		5.00		
35	MINOR CHANGE							
		CALC			0.00%		0.00%	
			-1.00	-1.00		-1.00		
36	SPCC PLAN							
		L.S.			100.00%		0.00%	
			1,000.00	2,000.00	1,000.00	1,000.00	0.00	
37	CONSTRUCTION GEOTEXTILE FOR SEPARATION							
	750.0000	S.Y.	5.0000	4.0000	-20.00%	2.0000	-60.00%	
			3,750.00	3,000.00	-750.00	1,500.00	-2,250.00	
38	SAW CUTTING BITUMINOUS ASPHALT							
	88.0000	L.F.	10.0000	20.0000	100.00%	20.0000	100.00%	
			880.00	1,760.00	880.00	1,760.00	880.00	
		BASE TOTAL	\$874,983.50	\$912,651.20	4.30%	\$969,609.00	10.81%	
ALTERNATE A1								
39	FURNISH AND PLACE TEMP. ST. CASING FOR SHAFT 6 FT DIAM.							
	660.0000	L.F.	250.0000	23.0000	-90.80%	50.0000	-80.00%	
			165,000.00	15,180.00	-149,820.00	33,000.00	-132,000.00	
		ALTERNATE A1 TOTAL	\$165,000.00	\$15,180.00	-90.80%	\$33,000.00	-80.00%	

DOT\_RGGB01

WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

DATE: 06/12/2007

\* \* \* BID CHECK REPORT \* \* \*

TIME: 13:14

PS&E JOB NO : 07C518 REVISION NO :  
 CONTRACT NO : 007371 REGION NO : 3  
 VERSION NO : 4 WORK ORDER# : XL2912

BIDS OPENED ON : Jun 20 2007

AWARDED ON : Jun 25 2007

HWY : SR 101  
 TITLE : US 101  
 MP 72.06 - SLOPE STABILIZATION

----- LOW BIDDER ----- 2ND BIDDER -----

ROGNLIN'S, INC.	QUIGG BROS., INC.
321 W STATE ST	819 W STATE ST
98520-6143	98520-5934
ABERDEEN WA 985200078	ABERDEEN WA 985200281
CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 706350	CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 680000

07C518  
 PROJECT : , STP-0101(295)  
 COUNTY(S) : GRAYS HARBOR

ITEM NO.	ITEM DESCRIPTION EST. QUANTITY	UNIT MEAS	ENGR'S. EST.		2ND BIDDER	
			PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.

ALTERNATE A2

40	FURNISH AND PLACE TEMP. ST. CASING FOR SHAFT 4 FT DIAM.						
	1530.0000	L.F.	107.8400	0.0000	-100.00%	0.0000	-100.00%
			164,995.20	0.00	-164,995.20	0.00	-164,995.20

ALTERNATE A2 TOTAL	<u>\$164,995.20</u>	<u>NO BID THIS ALTERNATE</u>	<u>NO BID THIS ALTERNATE</u>
--------------------	---------------------	------------------------------	------------------------------

BASE TOTAL	<u>\$874,983.50</u>	<u>\$912,651.20</u>	<u>4.30%</u>	<u>\$969,609.00</u>	<u>10.81%</u>
BASE + A1 CONTRACT TOTAL (A)	<u>\$1,039,983.50</u>	<u>\$927,831.20</u>	<u>-10.78%</u>	<u>\$1,002,609.00</u>	<u>-3.59%</u>
BASE + A2 CONTRACT TOTAL (A)	<u>\$1,039,978.70</u>	<u>NO BID THIS ALTERNATE</u>		<u>NO BID THIS ALTERNATE</u>	

DOT\_RGGB01

WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

PS&E JOB NO: 07C518

\* \* \* ALTERNATE COMBINATION BIDS \* \* \*

BIDS OPENED ON:

CONTRACT NO: 007371

\* \* \* RANKED BY DOLLAR AMOUNT \* \* \*

Jun 20 2007

TITLE: US 101

MP 72.06 - SLOPE STABILIZATION

REGION: 3

07C518

HWY: SR 101

1	\$927,831.20	BASE + A1	<b>ROGNLIN'S, INC.</b> 321 W STATE ST 98520-6143 PO BOX 307 ABERDEEN, WA 985200078
2	\$1,002,609.00	BASE + A1	<b>QUIGG BROS., INC.</b> 819 W STATE ST 98520-5934 PO BOX 1707 ABERDEEN, WA 985200281